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SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE
1. SIGNS, BANNERS AND RELATED PRODUCTS
PROJECT NO. 17-18-1019

Page 1 of 4

Huntington Sky
Production Gateway Printing & Imprezos Pro
VENDOR AGAS, Mfg. Bill Guthrie Sports, Inc. Copy Plus, LLC. Copy Zone, Ltd. EC Print & Design, LLC. DBA Fastsigns FedEx Office Office Supply, Inc. Images In Ink, Inc. Uniforms, LLC. The Sign Depot
ADDRESS 2701 E Tioga St 5701 W Expressway 83 [ 4500 N 10th Ste 240 4131 N 10th St 3101 N 21st St Ste A 4117 N 10th St 2812 N 10th St 315 S Closner 1200 E Hackberry Ste H 1317 W US Hwy 83 Ste A 1915 N 10th Ste B
CITY/STATE/ZIP Philadelphia, PA 19134 Harlingen, TX 78552 McAllen, TX 78504 McAllen, TX 78504 McAllen, TX 78501 McAllen, TX 78504 McAllen, TX 78501 Edinburg, TX 78539 McAllen, TX 78501 Pharr, TX 78577 McAllen, TX 78501
PHONE 212-777-1178 956-428-6462 956-668-7587 956-668-9600 956-627-3987 956-618-1800 956-682-4040 956-383-3861 956-330-3725 956-685-5099 956-897-0566
FAX 212-202-4830 956-428-7074 956-668-7590 956-668-9603 956-618-5088 956-682-4013 956-316-0253 056-994-8133 866-733-8509 956-702-1285
CONTACT Matthew Poster Joey Mackie Leonel Cantu Daniel Clarke Angelica Martinez Jessica Reyes Humberto Barberena Butch Shook Viola Hanshaw Francisco Javier Morales Andy Long
# Description Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed
Catalog Discount
| |(Signs, Flags and Banners) 25% 0% 0-25% 0% 0% 0% 30% 0% 10% 10% 25%
Catalog Discount
2 |(Retractable Banner Stands) 25% 0% 0-25% 0% 0% 0% 30% 0% 10% 10% 25%
Catalog Discount
3 |(Yard/Metal/Real Estate Signs) 25% 0% 0-25% 0% 0% 0% 30% 0% 10% 10% 25%
Catalog Discount
4 [(Table Covers) 25% 0% 0-25% 0% 0% 0% No Bid 0% 10% 10% 25%
Catalog Discount
5 [|(Feather Flags) 25% 0% 0-25% 0% 0% 0% No Bid 0% 10% 10% 25%
Catalog Discount
6 |(Name Plates/Office Entrance Signs) 25% 0% 0-25% 0% 0% 0% No Bid 0% 10% 10% 25%
$75/Graphic Hour
"Layout" Time is $0.00 All prices include
7 |Set-Up Charges $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 prorated $10 per Job Ticket $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 set up fee No Charge
$5.00 McAllen $30.00 for Table
$15.00 Weslaco Runners, Table Covers, |$15.00 Delivery Fee/Free | No Charge to the Pecan
8 |Shipping Charges $0.00 $0.00 Free Delivery in the RGV| $25.00 Rio Grande City & Feather Flags in Store Pick Up Location $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Charge
We follow our order and
We do not accept any proof process to avoid
Within 24 hours of returned merchandise. Custom printed products any returns. Returns are
Will vary case by case; | Inspection/delivery of All of our items are 100% Satisfaction, We [cannot be returned unless only on manufacturer's |Replace or Refund Full
9 |Return Policy Returns within a month| 20% Restocking Fee No Returns from full refund to zero. product custom made. will fix the issue Gateway made the error | Yes Customer Satisfied defects. Purchase Price
Number of days for delivery once 2 Weeks Depending on
10 |order is placed 14 Days 14 Days 0-7 Days 1-5 Days 3 days 1-7 Business Days 2 Days 1-5 days Qty 10 days 1-3 Days
Hanging (Matte Material)
11 |6 ft x 4 ft Banner $49.00 $90.00 $63.89 $95.50 $84.00 $139.00 $54.00 $65.00 $230.00 $82.00 $54.00
Hanging (Vinyl Glossy)
12 |6 ft x 4 ft Banner $49.00 $90.00 $63.89 $95.50 $84.00 $139.00 $54.00 $85.00 $230.00 $82.00 $54.00




SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE
1. SIGNS, BANNERS AND RELATED PRODUCTS
PROJECT NO. 17-18-1019

Page 2 of 4

Huntington Sky

Production Gateway Printing & Imprezos Pro
VENDOR AGAS, Mfg. Bill Guthrie Sports, Inc. Copy Plus, LLC. Copy Zone, Ltd. EC Print & Design, LLC, DBA Fastsigns FedEx Office Office Supply, Inc. Images In Ink, Inc. Uniforms, LLC. The Sign Depot
# Description Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed
Retractable Banner Matte and Stand
13 [33" x 83" banner including stand $106.00 $160.00 $220.00 $201.88 $239.99 $490.00 $110.00 $250.00
14 133.5" x 83" Economy Retractor Kit $345.00
34" x 83" banner including stand
15 |More-Expo Campaign Ready $237.00
35" x 83" banner including stand
16 [Bric Cabrio With Change Out $415.00
33" x 80" banner including stand
17 |Ret-10m $149.95
Replacement Banner Matte Only
18 |33in x 83 in $40.50 $90.00 $56.80 $131.63 $142.00 $39.99 $230.00 $300.00 $65.00 $42.00
19 |33 in x 83 in Only Cabrio Kit $120.00
Yard Signs (Coroplast) with "H" Stake Frame; Printed; Double Sided; Full Color
20 [I18inx 12in $6.75 $54.00 $12.99 $26.00 $18.00 $10.00 $29.99 $90.00 $290.00 $10.50 $7.00
21 [24inx 18 in $9.25 $54.00 $31.26 $46.00 $30.00 $16.00 $29.99 $100.00 $350.00 $12.00 $10.00
Yard Signs (Coroplast) with ""H" Stake Frame; BLANK
22 |18inx 12in $4.90 $10.50 $7.92 $5.00 $2.50 $6.00 $4.99 $25.00 $250.00 $5.00 $3.50
23 [24inx 18in $5.40 $19.25 $13.32 $5.50 $3.50 $9.00 $6.99 $35.00 $300.00 $6.00 54.00
Metal Sign and Black Frame/Real Estate Sign
24 IZ4 inx 18 in ‘ $15.50 $54.00 l $42.08 $65.00 $50.00 $34.00 59.99 $299.71 No Bid $16.00 [ $19.50
A Frame Signs
25 |36" x 24" ! $42.50 $260.00 [ $161.20 $198.00 $233.45 $24.72 89.99 $201.78 $390.00 $195.00 [ $65.00
Table Covers (Custom Made)
26 |6 ft Table (28 in x 72 in x 30 in) $195.00 $250.00 $255.00 $250.00 $275.44 $133.00 No Bid $347.00 $300.00 $260.00 $275.00
27 [8 ft Table (28 in x 96 in x 30 in) $215.00 $275.00 $285.00 $290.00 $299.44 $152.00 No Bid $372.00 $350.00 $275.00 $305.00
Table Covers (Blank)
28 |6 ft Table (28 in x 72 in x 30 in) $24.50 $125.00 No Bid $25.00 $145.84 $133.00 No Bid $185.00 $100.00 $160.00 $135.00
29 |8 ft Table (28 in x 96 in x 30 in) $29.50 $150.00 No Bid $30.00 $153.84 $152.00 No Bid $210.00 $100.00 $175.00 $165.00
Table Runners (Full Color Logo)
30 34" x 80" $64.00
31 |54"x 80 $94.00
32 [35" x 80" $149.00 $240.00 $80.60 $75.60 $108.00 No Bid $275.00 $490.00 $175.00 $180.00
33 [55" x 80" $159.00 $250.00 $134.50 $126.00 $143.00 No Bid $290.00 $490.00 $180.00 $285.00




SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE
1. SIGNS, BANNERS AND RELATED PRODUCTS
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Huntington Sky
Production Gateway Printing & Imprezos Pro
VENDOR AGAS, Mfg. Bill Guthrie Sports, Inc. Copy Plus, LLC. Copy Zone, Lid. EC Print & Design, LLC. DBA Fastsigns FedEx Office Office Supply. Inc. Images In Ink, Inc. Uniforms, LLC. The Sign Depot
# Description Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed Proposed
Feather Flags
34 |8 ft. feather flag $63.00 No Bid $155.60 $191.98 $140.00 No Bid $235.00 $350.00 $130.00 $50.00
35 [9ft small $185.00
Wall Mount Name Plate
$25.00
36 [2inx 10inx 1/16in $9.46 No Bid $13.75 No Bid $3.96 10+ $20.00 ea No Bid 10.95 $50.00 - $75.00 $20.00 $11.00
Wall Mount Frame for Name Plate (Silver)
$15.50
37 |2inx 10in x 1/16 in_name plate $2.95 No Bid $12.25 No Bid $8.42 10+ $12.00ea No Bid 10.95 §75.00 $10.00 $4.50
Desk Mounting Frame for Name Plate (Silver)
$15.50
38 [2in x 10in x 1/16 in name plate $4.75 No Bid $12.25 No Bid 16.15 10+ $12.00ea No Bid 13.95 $75.00 $9.59 $6.50
Office Entrance Sign
39 |8 inx 10in x 1/16 in $17.50 No Bid $55.95 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid $40.00 $50.00 - $75.00 $55.00 $19.00
40 |Price Escalation for 2nd Year 0% 5% 0% 0% 0% 0% 5% 0% 5% 0% 0%
41 |Price Escalation for 3rd Year 0% 10% 0% 0% 0% 0% 10% 0% 5% 0% 1%
TOTAL EVALUATION POINTS 65.71 41.44 60 61.92 58.55 68.83 70.1 57.2 46.95 60.81 78.73
RANKING + 11 7 5 8 3 2 9 10 6 1




1. SIGNS, BANNERS, AND RELATED PRODUCTS

SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE

PROJECT NO. 17-18-1019 -- EVALUATION SUMMARY

Page 4 of 4

Huntington Sky

Bill Guthrie EC Print Production Gateway Printing & Imprezos Pro
VENDOR AGAS, Mfg. Sports, Inc. Copy Plus, LLC. Copy Zone, Ltd. & Design, LLC. dba/Fastsigns FedEx Office Office Supply, Inc. Images In Ink, Inc. Uniforms, LLC. The Sign Depot
ADDRESS 2701 E Tioga St 5701 W Expressway 83 4500 N 10th Ste 240 4131 N 10th St 3101 N 21st St Ste A 4117 N 10th St 2812 N 10th St 315 S Closner 1200 E Hackberry Ste H [1317 W US Hwy 83 Ste A] 1915 N 10th Ste B
CITY/STATE/ZIP Philadelphia, PA 19134 [ Harlingen, TX 78552 McAllen, TX 78504 McAllen, TX 78504 McAllen, TX 78501 McAllen, TX 78504 McAllen, TX 78501 Edinburg, TX 78339 McAllen, TX 78501 Pharr, TX 78577 McAllen, TX 78501
PHONE 212-777-1178 056-428-6462 956-668-7587 956-668-9600 956-627-3987 956-618-1800 956-682-4040 956-383-3861 956-330-3725 956-6835-5099 956-897-0566
FAX 212-202-4830 956-428-7074 956-668-7590 956-668-9603 956-618-5088 956-682-4013 956-316-0253 956-994-8133 866-733-8509 956-702-1285
CONTACT Matthew Poster Joey Mackie Leonel Cantu Daniel Clarke Angelica Martinez Jessica Reyes Humberto Barberena Jeff Talbert Viola Hanshaw Francisco ] Morales Andy Long
3571 14.19 19 20.42 22.05 2233 24.1 1045 72 2281 29.48
g 24.1 10.45 2281
1 (TuhLIi”;h“:;E;“‘ 3571 35.71 121 14.19 1 19 LIL 2042 2205 2205 LEE 2233 24.1 10.45 LIz 7.2 2281 2948 29.48
e 3571 14.19 19 20.42 22.05 2233 4.1 10.45 72 2281 2948
35.71 14.19 19 20.42 22.05 22.33 24.1 1045 72 22.81 29.48
9 7 8
The reputation of the vendor ! L i L Y J 5 2
; o S . < 9 8 6
2 and .Ul the vendor's goods and/or ] 65 5 7 8 75 8 805 5 6 8 8.5 925 85 7 75 75 9 9
SETVICES. 5 5 5 ] 5 " 10 10 7 8 10
(up to 10 points) - 5
8 9 8 9 7 9 9 9 8 8 8
12 13 13 13 13 17 17 14 14 16 17
"The quality of the vendor's 14 13 9
3 |goods and/or services. L. 11.75 2 9 10 11.75 2 11.75 g 11.75 LEl 15 15.5 15 13 13.25 12.75 L 16
(up to 18 points) 13 9 13 14 13 14 16 18 14 14 18
13 5 11 1 13 16 15 15 12 12 15
17 17 8
The extent to which the vendor's £ - S L 12 1l L 15
T s 16 13 10
;| BRDTS BRU/Or SerNicasidgBLIhe = 475 : 7.5 L 13.5 13 13.75 8 1175 10 14.25 16.25 15.5 13 1325 9.5 16 16.75
College's needs. 4 G 4 5 5 16 18 o 12 18
(up to 18 points) - 1 L 1 16
4 4 14 14 12 14 16 14 12 8 17
) 2 3 3 2 3 3 3 3 E 3
The vendor's past relationship ) 3 5 2 S 5 3 2 5 ) 3
5 |with the College. 2 2 = 2.25 275 = 2 = 2.75 3 275 275 2.5 - 3
(up to 3 points) 2 2 2 3 2 3 3 3 3 3 3
3 2 3 3 2 3 3 3 3 3 3
The impact on the ability of the 0 0 1 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 0
College to comply with laws and 0 0 1
6 |rules relating 1o Historically d 0 d 0 ! 1 g 0 2 0 1 1 0 0 2 0] 0.75 0 0
Underutilized Businesses, 0 0 1 0 0 1 0 0 0 1 0
ool patnl) 0 0 1 0 0 1 0 0 0 ! 0
2 5 5
‘The total long-term cost to the 3 2 3 3 2 2 2 i
~ollege to acquire the ve ' 2 5 5
5 College to du.lum. the vendor's 5 5 2 s 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 5 2 5 3 3 5 4.5 45
goods or services. 5 5 5
: 5 2 5 ] 5 5 ¥ 3 E 4.5
(up 10 5 points)
5 2 5 5 5 5 2 3 3 3 4.5
TOTAL EVALUATION POINTS 63.71 41.44 60 61.92 68.83 70.1 37.2 46.95 60.81 78.73
RANKING 4 11 7 5 3 2 9 10 6 1
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SOUTH TEXAS SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE
COLLEGE 2. BIRTHING SIMULATOR

NAME Gaumard
ADDRESS 14700 SW 136th St
CITY/STATE/ZIP Miami, FL 33196
PHONE 305-971-3790

FAX 305-252-0755
CONTACT Alva Gaskey

Description Unit Price | Extension

Victoria Light Skin Tone Advanced
Birthing Simulator $ 62,500.00 [ $ 62,500.00

Estimated Freight 500.00 500.00

TOTAL AMOUNT 63,000.00

Purchasing Department - Board Report






SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE
SOUTH TEXAS 3. INSTRUCTIONAL TRAINING MANNEQUIN

COLLEGE

NAME

Laerdal Medical
Corporation

ADDRESS

167 Myers Corners Rd

CITY/STATE/ZIP

Wappingers Falls, NY 12590

PHONE

888-297-7772

FAX

800-227-1143

CONTACT

Sherri Brister

Description

Unit Price Extension

Sim Man 3G Light Mannequin and
Accessories

$ 67,849.22 | § 67,849.22

Estimated Freight

27578 275.78

TOTAL AMOUNT

68,125.00

Purchasing Department - Board Report
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SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE

SOUTH TEXAS 4. CHILL WATER CHILLER

COLLEGE

NAME

Johnson Controls

ADDRESS

10600 Colonel Glen Rd

CITY/STATE/ZIP

Little Rock, AR 72204

PHONE

956-535-2718

FAX

956-428-1591

CONTACT

Adalberto Cavazos

Description

Unit Price Extension

YMC2 - York Magnetic VSD
Centrifugal Chiller

Includes: Installation, Piping Work,
Rigging Services, Electrical Work, and
Removal of Old Chiller

$ 297,012.28 | $ 297,012.28

TOTAL AMOUNT

297,012.28

Purchasing Department - Board Report
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SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE

SOUTH TEXAS 5. DISTRICT WIDE FURNITURE REQUEST
COLLEGE DECEMBER 12, 2017

Qty Description Unit Price Extension Requesting Department

Inc./Gateway Printing and Office Supply, Inc. (National IPA/TCPN)

896942P Acoustical Panel 69H x 42W Low Profile Painted $200.08 $2,200.88 New Fumiture - Ricardo De La Garza
802569P 69H Wall Mounting Kit Painted $53.68 $322.08 Panel Partitions for faculty and staff offices
801069P Straight Conn Kit 69H Low Profile Painted $24.71 $271.81 at Nursing Portable Bldgs. 2 and 3
801169P Ell Conn Kit 69H Low Profile Painted $42.09 $252.54
801469P Panel End Cover-Fabric 69H Low Profile Painted $24.71 $148.26
896930P Acoustical Panel 69H x 30W Low Profile Painted $161.96 $5971.76
896960P Acoustical Panel 69H x 60W Low Profile Painted $232.11 $2,785.32
896942P Acoustical Panel 69H x 42W Low Profile Painted $200.08 $4,401.76
802569P 69H Wall Mounting Kit Painted $53.68 $644.16
801069P Straight Conn Kit 69H Low Profile $24.71 $543.62
801169P Ell Conn Kit 69H Low Profile Painted $42.09 $505.08
801469P Panel End Cover-Fabric 69H Low Profile Painted $24.71 $296.52
896930P Acoustical Panel 69H x 30W Low Profile Painted $161.96 $1,943.52

Labor to receive, inspect, deliver, install and remove debris $1,528.00 $1,528.00
Allsteel, Inc. Total $16,815.31

American Seating Company/Gateway Printing and Office Supply, Inc. (TXMAS)
1 | 30 |FGE22300HOHGGR Nima Swivel Base Desk Chairs, No Arms $187.93 $5,637.90 Learning Commons and Open Labs - Leila Salinas

Chairs will be used at the new Learning Commons Area
at Mid Valley Campus

Labor to receive, inspect, deliver, install and remove debris $750.00 $750.00
American Seating Company Total $6,387.90

is Corporation/Gateway Printing and Office Supply, Inc. (National IPA/TCPN)

CP.ASI1.SNI Composium Sharp Seating Club 34Hx3 1 Wx28D $989.00 $7,912.00 Learning Commons and Open Labs - Leila Salinas
Seating will be used at the new Learning Commons Area
at Mid Valley Campus

40Y.A17 TR2 Sit On It Task Enhanced Synchro Control Chair $328.42 $1,313.68 Facility Maintenance - George McCaleb
Chair will be used by Maintenance Staff]

40Y.A17 TR2 Sit On It Task Enhanced Synchro Control Chair $328.42 $328.42 Learning Commons and Open Labs - Leila Salinas
Chair will be used by Open Labs Staff at Mid Valley Campus

Purchasing Department - Board Report
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SOUTH TEXAS 5. DISTRICT WIDE FURNITURE REQUEST
COLLEGE DECEMBER 12, 2017

Qty Description Unit Price Extension Requesting Department

5 _|40Y.A17 TR2 Sit On It Task Enhanced Synchro Control Chair $328.42 $1,642.10 New Furniture - Ricardo De La Garza
10 |140Y.A17 TR2 Sit On It Task Enhanced Synchro Control Chair $328.42 $3,284.20 Chairs for faculty and staff offices

at Nursing Portable Bldgs. 2 and 3

Labor to receive, inspect, deliver, install and remove debris $1,291.00 $1,291.00
Exemplis Corporation Total $15,771.40

The Hon Company/Gateway Printing and Office Supply, Inc. (National IPA/TCPN)

1| 1 |HSC2472 Storage Cabinet 24D x 36W x 72H $417.90 $417.90 Learning Commons and Open Labs - Leila Salinas
Storage Cabinet will be used at the Open Labs at
Technology Campus

HSC2472 Storage Cabinet 24D x 36W x 72H $417.90 $417.90 Learning Commons and Open Labs - Leila Salinas
Storage Cabinet will be used at the Open Labs at
Pecan Campus

HS72ABC Brigade Bookcase 5-Shelf 12-5/8D x 34-1/2W x 71H $184.80 $924.00 New Furniture - Ricardo De La Garza
HS72ABC Brigade Bookcase 5-Shelf 12-5/8D x 34-1/2W x 71H $184.80 $1,848.00 Bookcases for faculty and staff offices
at Nursing Portable Bldgs. 2 and 3

Labor to receive, inspect, deliver, install and remove debris $405.00 $405.00
The Hon Company Total $4,012.80

Krueger International, Inc./Gateway Printing and Office Supply, Inc. (NJPA)

1 RAPWAUS Rapture Four-Leg Armchair Uphold $194.88 $389.76 Department of Psychological Science - Janene Israel
Guest chairs will be used at Starr County

Psychological Science Program

7D/D3066-74P-F Desk Full Modesty Panel, 74P Edge 30x66"W $558.72 $558.72 Learning Commons and Open Labs - Leila Salinas
7D/R2448-74P-F Desk, Return, Full Modesty Pancl, 74P Edge, 24x48"W $406.08 $406.08 Desk will be used by Open Labs staff at Mid Valley Campus
ST7P/1530WBBF Files Supporting Ped-Box/Box/File - 30" Nominal Depth $408.00 $408.00
STP/1524WFF Files Supporting Ped-File/File 24" Nominal Depth $353.76 $353.76

RAPWAUS Rapture Four-Leg Armchair,Uph Seat/Poly Back $194.88 $974.40 New Furniture - Ricardo De La Garza
7D/D3066-74P-F Desk, Full Modesty Panel,74P Edge 30x66"W $558.72 $2,793.60 Desks and Guest Charis for Faculty and Staff Offices
7D/R2448-74P-F Desk, Return, Full Modesty Panel, 74P Edge24x48"W $406.08 $2,030.40 at Nursing Portable Bldgs. 2 and 3

Purchasing Department - Board Report
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SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE
5. DISTRICT WIDE FURNITURE REQUEST
DECEMBER 12, 2017

Description

Unit Price

Extension

Requesting Department

S7P/1530WBBF Files Supporting Ped-Box/Box/File-30" Nominal

$408.00

$2,040.00

S7P/1524WFF Files Supporting Ped-File/File-24" Nominal Depth

$353.76

51,768.80

RAPWAUS Rapture Four-Leg Armchair,Uph Seat/Poly Back

5194.88

51,948.80

7D/D3066-74P-F Desk, Full Modesty Panel, 74P Edge,30x66"W

§558.72

$5,587.20

7D/R2448-74P-F Desk, Return, Full Modesty Panel, 74P Edge,24x48"W

$406.08

$4,060.80

S7P/1530WBBF Files Supporting Ped-Box/Box/File-30" Nominal

$408.00

$4,080.00

S7P/1524WFF Files Supporting Ped-File/File-24" Nominal Depth

$353.76

$3,537.60

Labor to receive, inspect, deliver, install and remove debris

$3,020.00

$3,020.00

Krueger International, Inc. Total

$33,957.92

National Office Furniture/Gateway Printing and Office Supply, Inc.

(National IPA/TCPN)

1

WW2448WSSL Waveworks Rectangular Table, 24Dx48 W

$139.50

§139.50

Learning Commons and Open Labs - Leila Salinas

1

CBV2448ABES Base Support for 24Dx48W Top Adjustable Height

$836.10

$836.10

Tables will be used at the new Learning Commons Area

8

10N1622RTPU Universal Pull Up Table 16Dx22W

$429.75

$3,438.00

at Mid Valley Campus

Labor to receive, inspect, deliver, install and remove debris

$400.00

$400.00

National Office Furniture Total

$4,813.60

Watson/Gateway Printing and Office Supply, Inc. (NCPA)

1

1

Tonic Bench Arrow 8 Pack W.A.

10,121.93

10,121.93

Learning Commons and Open Labs - Leila Salinas

1

Tonic Bench Arrow 10 Pack W.A.

12,739.02

12,739.02

Tables will be used at the new Learning Commons Area

at Mid Valley Campus

Labor to receive, inspect, deliver, install and remove debris

2,286.00

2,286.00

Watson Total

$25,146.95

Furniture Total

$106,905.88

Purchasing Department - Board Report
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eV s, Purchasing and Distribution Services
AAS 3200 W. Pecan Blvd., McAllen TX 78501

VW 1(956) 872-4681

SOUTH TEXAs | !(756)872:4688
COLLEGE

PO Box 9701, Mcallen, TX 78502-9701
www.SouthTexasCollege.edu

November 9, 2017

Education To Go/A Division of
Cengage Learning

Attn: Beverly M. Jones

5191 Natop Blvd.

Mason, OH 45040

Dear Ms. Jones:

On March 29, 2016, South Texas College awarded a contract to Education To Go/A Division of
Cengage Learning for Online Continuing Education Services. The award allowed for two one-
year renewal options on the contract if the terms and conditions remain the same. We are
currently in the last few months of the second year of the contract and would like to renew fot an
additional one-year period. The last renewal period will be from March 30, 2018 through March
29, 2019.

We are requesting that you respond to us in writing if this would be acceptable to your company.
For your convenience, we are providing a place for your signature approval at the bottom of the
letter. If in acceptance of this extension, you may sign where indicated. The letter may be return
via fax at (956) 872-4688 or email to Becky Cavazos at beckyc@southtexascollege.edu.

Sincerely,

b G

Rebecca R, Cavazos
Director of Purchasing

Renewal of contract accepted through
per the South Texas College bid previ

Wh 29,2 ith no change in terms and conditions as
L]

Authorized Signature:

MName Printed; __ (Q{?&M [gmé;?_/
Date: ///;//‘4:/25/;7
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oY Purchasing and Distribution Services
VA 3200 W. Pecan Blvd., McAllen TX 78501
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SOUTH TEXAs | 1199618724488

COLLEGE
P.0) Box 9701, McAllen, TX 78502 9701
www.SouthTexasCollege.edu
November 9, 2017
World Education LLC
Attn: Mr. Chris Gores
PO Box 151526

Arlington, TX 76015
Dear Mr. Gores:

On March 29, 2016, South Texas College awarded a contract to World Education LLC for
Online Continuing Education Services. The award allowed for two one-year renewal options on
the contract if the terms and conditions remain the same. We are currently in the last few months

of the second year of the contract and would like to renew for an additional one-year period. The
last renewal period will be from March 30, 2018 through March 29, 2019.

We are requesting that you respond to us in writing if this would be acceptable to your company.
For your convenience, we are providing a place for your signature approval at the bottom of the
letter. If in acceptance of this extension, you may sign where indicated. The letter may be return
via fax at (956) 872-4688 or email to Becky Cavazos at beckyc@southtexascollege.edu.

Sincerely,

b G

Rebecca R. Cavazos
Director of Purchasing

Renewal of contract accepted through March 29, 2019 with no change in terms and conditions as
per the South Texas College bid previously submitted.
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SOUTH TEXAS COLLEGE

SOUTH TEXAS 1. TIMEKEEPING SYSTEM CLOCKS

COLLEGE

Time Clock Plus by Data
Management, Inc.

1 Time Clock Dr
San Angelo, TX 76904
325-223-9500
April Bearden

NAME
ADDRESS
CITY/STATE/ZIP
PHONE
CONTACT

Description

Unit Price

Extension

Bio RDT Touch 400

2,449.00

$ 53,878.00

Hardware Maintenance

8,059.56

$ 8,059.56

Professional Employee Licenses

30.00

$ 15,000.00

Software Maintenance

2,794.52

§ 2,794.52

Shipping and Handling

169.64

169.64

TOTAL AMOUNT

79,732.08

Purchasing Department - Board Report






